From: ROBERT STEPHENSON rs41@comcast.net
Subject: Fwd: FW: Payable
Date: June 22, 2022 at 10:30 AM
To: rob@rs41.org

---------- Original Message ----------

From: Todd Croteau <tcroteau@townofjaffrey.com>
To: Robert Stephenson <rs41@comcast.net>

Date: 06/21/2022 12:10 PM

Subject: FW: Payable

Rob,

See below from Katy. Correspondence with Elisa states the were both paid and mailed out last week.

Kind regards,
Todd

Todd J. Croteau

Superintendent of Highways and Facilities
23 Knight Street

Jaffrey, NH 03452

603-532-6521

From: Katy Lyons <klyons@townofjaffrey.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2022 10:38 AM

To: Accounts Payable <ap @townofjaffrey.com>

Cc: Elisa FitzGerald <efitzgerald @townofjaffrey.com>; Todd Croteau <tcroteau @townofjaffrey.com>
Subject: Payable

Good morning,
| have attached 2 invoices that were sent to be paid on 6/1/22. Could you please let me know the status?

Thanks

Katy Lyons




Town of Jaffrey

Department of Public Works
23 Knight Street

Jaffrey, NH 03452

(603) 532-6521

The Town of Jaffrey prohibits discrimination on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, sexual orientation,
religion, age, disability, marital or family status.

The Town of Jaffrey is an equal opportunity employer.
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